
 

 

 

Proposed Species Options 
 

Option 1 – Combination of species 

Powerline side of road 

Tristaniopsis laurina (Luscious Kanooka) 

 

 

 

 

 

An Australian native. Leaves are dark green, 
shiny and large. New growth starts in a 
distinctive copper colour and further 
interest appears over time with the 
branches developing deep purple coloured 
bark which peels back to reveal a smooth, 
cream trunk. Flowers are yellow and 
sweetly perfumed, appearing in clusters 
through summer. 

Mature Size  

Height x Width (m): 8m x 4m 

Form: Oval 

 

Non-powerline side of road 

Callistemon viminalis (Weeping Bottle Brush) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

This is a pretty bird-attracting tree with a 
heavy crown due to the profusion of brilliant 
red flowers in spring and summer. It is the 
weight of these flowers that gives it a 
pendulous habit. 

Mature Size  

Height x Width (m): 6-8m x 6-8m 

Form: Round 
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Option 2 – Combination of species 

Powerline side of road 

Eucalyptus mannifera 'little spotty' (Little Spotty)  

 

 

 

 

 

‘Little spotty' is a small, slender, very 
hardy, evergreen tree. The leaves are fine 
and grey-green in colour and the bark is 
creamy white with cream or red patches. It 
has lovely masses of cream coloured 
flowers from winter to summer, which is 
great for attracting nectar-feeding birds. 

 

Mature Size  

Height x Width (m): 5-7m x 6m 

Form: Round 

 

Non-powerline side of road 

Lophostemon confertus (Queensland Brush Box)  

 

 

 

 

 

This is a fast growing tree. Dome-like in 
shape, it develops a very dense foliage cover 
of dark green, leathery leaves providing 
good shade for the summer months. 
Summer also brings clusters of small white 
flowers whose stamens give them a 
decorative fluffy appearance. 

 

Mature Size  

Height x Width (m): 10m x 15m 

Form: Oval 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

Option 3 – Single species (both sides of the road) 

Acer platanoides 'Crimson Sentry' (Crimson Sentry Norway Maple) 

 

 

 

 

This is a flashy crimson foliaged maple with 
dense upright branching. It has a compact 
growth habit with its large crimson leaves in 
summer turning to gold and orange in 
autumn. Adds great colour contrast foliage. 
A small tree with greyish-black bark that is 
lightly textured. 

 

Mature Size  

Height x Width (m): 7m x 4m 

Form: Upright 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


